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Tumbledown Decks St. Joe RD 73 8,793         Ton 10/19/2021 1.10$               1. PotlatchDeltic Land & Lumber,  LLC 15.00$            
Salvage 2. Stimson Lumber Company 14.68$            

Avista Settlement CDA River RD 10 198            CCF 10/25/2021 3.00$               1. Avista Utilities 3.00$              
2021

Deceitful Decks CDA River RD 55 5,128         Ton 11/2/2021 1.01$               1. Hubert Jenneskens, Inc.  1.75$              
2. IFG Timber, LLC 1.52$              

Bumblebee Salvage CDA River RD 16 2,249         Ton 11/10/2021 9.46$               1. Daugherty Enterprises, Inc. 14.00$            
2021 SBA

Big Mann Reoffer CDA River RD 364 33,968      Ton 12/1/2021 11.39$             NO BID NO BID

Old Highway Salvage Bonners Ferry 9 56              CCF 5/23/2022 73.75$             1. Green Turf Company 81.03$            
RD 2. Pinkerton Resources, LLC 78.25$            

3. Schnuerle Bros. Logging, INC 75.00$            

Grouse Deck Sandpoint RD 0.5 50              Cords 6/21/2022 40.00$             1. M Davis Logging, LLC 40.00$            
 

Snow-Lo Bonners Ferry 857 70,208      Ton 7/19/2022 25.25$             1. ALTA Forest Products, LLC 40.25$            
RD 2. IFG Timber, LLC 34.93$            

3. Stimson Lumber Company 27.73$            

Eagle Salvage CDA River 275 14,676      Ton 8/17/2022 7.71$               NO BID NO BID
SBA

Betchtel Beauty St. Joe RD 554 120,861    Ton 8/23/2022 25.84$             Bennett Lumber Products, Inc. 26.17$            
SBA

Rock Carpenter CDA River 671 59,079      Ton 8/31/2022 7.62$               NO BID NO BID
Salvage

Cedar Creek CDA River 753 58,591      Ton 9/14/2022 6.46$               IFG Timber LLC 7.04$              
Salvage

Shearing Marble St. Joe RD 623 122,201    Ton 9/14/2022 23.39$             1. IFG Timber LLC 46.76$            
2. Stimson Lumber Company 42.94$            
3. Potlatchdeltic Land & Lumber LLC 35.00$            

Eagle Salvage CDA River 275 14,679      Ton 9/20/2022 5.61$               NO BID NO BID
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