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Bidders Bid Rate*

Bernard Deck Sandpoint RD 1 84              CCF 10/30/2020 20.43$           1. Green Turf Company 22.475$      
2. Paul Glazier 20.96$        

Priest Lake RD 10 50              CCF 10/30/2020 40.62$           1. Ted Buck 41.13$        
2. Paul Glazier 40.63$        

1,122 139,008    Ton 11/19/2020 20.44$           1. IFG Timber LLC 30.83$        
2. PotlatchDeltic Land & Lumber LLC 26.13$        

St. Joe RD 1 13 CCF 12/1/2020 40.62$           1. PotlatchDeltic Land & Lumber LLC 40.62$        

240 5,647         Ton 12/30/2020 19.00$           1. Ron Cummings 35.25$        
2. Green Turf Company 31.31$        
3. Seth Burnett 21.35$        

818 87,284      Ton 1/5/2021 18.13$           1. IFG Timber LLC **

Lookout Pass Settlement 3 CDA River RD 80 1,203         CCF 4/23/2021 18.17$           1. Lookout Associates LLC 18.17$        

1 7                 CCF 4/27/2021 30.00$           1.Ted Buck 30.00$        

567 48,371      Ton 6/3/2021 28.70$           1. Weyerhaeuser NR Company 42.28$        
2. IFG Timber LLC 37.06$        
3. Stimson Lumber Company 31.98$        

61 47              CCF 6/23/2021 40.62$           1. Schnuerle Brothers Logging 41.20$        
2. Pinkerton Resources LLC 40.63$        

61 163            CCF 6/23/2021 61.32$           1. Pinkerton Resources LLC 64.33$        
2. Schnuerle Brothers Logging 63.50$        

614 68,297      Ton 8/26/2021 23.54$           1.IFG Timber LLC 24.11$        

364 33,968      Ton 9/9/2021 19.90$           1.NO BID NO BID

28 759            Ton 9/13/2021 23.54$           1.NO BID NO BID

413 66,299      Ton 9/21/2021 29.61$           1. Stimson Lumber Company 40.76$        
2. PotlatchDeltic 34.53$        

Trout Creek Decks Salvage Sandpoint RD 1 42 CCF 9/28/2021 109.27$         1. Green Turf Company 124.70$      
2. Akre Logging, LLC 115.05$      

Idamont

Grassy Elk CDA River RD

Bonners Ferry RD

Brushy Blowdown III Salvage

Templeman Blowdown 
Salvage

Bonners Ferry RD

Bonners Ferry RD

Beyond Hope Salvage Sandpoint RD

Timbuk Stew Bonners Ferry RD

SO Salvage Decks Re-offer CDA River RD
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Sale Results for Fiscal Year 2021 (10/01/2020 - 09/30/2021) *Rates for sales with non fixed split pricing are displayed as a weighted average

Roundhouse St. Joe RD

Stout Overlook Settlement

PREF Salvage

Davies Home St Maries RD

2021 Mineral Ridge Salvage CDA River RD

Big Mann CDA River RD


