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Dry Creek Seed Orchard Salvage Sandpoint 6 64              CCF 10/4/2022 59.70$                       NO BID NO BID

Dry Creek Seed Orchard Salvage Reoffer Sandpoint 6 64              CCF 11/7/2022 23.44$                       NO BID NO BID

Rock Carpenter Salvage Reoffer CDA River 314 33,103      Tons 11/10/2022 1.33$                         IFG LLC 1.33$              

Mineral Ridge Salvage SBA CDA River 29 496            Tons 3/7/2023 11.27$                       Hubert Jenneskens INC 14.77$            

Smoked Trout Salvage Bonners Ferry 82 3,233        Tons 9/13/2023 8.07$                         Ryan Logging, LLC 18.21$            
Alta Forest Products 15.84$            
Pinkerton Resources 9.11$              

Swamp Post St. Joe 617 135,338    Tons 9/19/2023 8.18$                         Stimson Lumber Company 20.93$            
IFG LLC 19.30$            

PotlatchDeltic 18.20$            

Lookout Decks 2023 Settlement CDA River 1 51              CCF 9/26/2023 3.00$                         Lookout Associates 3.00$              

Pee Wee Stewardship St. Joe 564 138,432    Tons 9/22/2023 18.56$                       Stimson Lumber Company 29.98$            
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Sale Results for Fiscal Year 2023 (10/01/2022 - 09/30/2023) *Rates for sales with non fixed split pricing are displayed as a weighted average


